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s Indore is the largest city of Madhya Pradesh bearing a population of 19,64,086. (1)

The city heavily depends on River Narmada and Yashwant Sagar for its water supply.
There are mainly 2 urban local bodies in Indore that govern the municipal services
namely the Indore Municipal Corporation and Indore Development Authority. Indore
city does not have a suitable sewerage assembling and exchange structure. The IMC is
working to repair the sewer lines and make it operational. Sewer and drainage are
governed by IDA, IMC[1], Department of Water Supply and Sanitation and Central
Public Health and Environmental Engineering Organisation (CPHEEO).[2] The storm
water drainage is guided by the river system of Khan and Saraswati. About 350 kms of
the major roads lead to primary drains and their condition is fairly good. Storm water
drainage is operated and looked after by IDA, IMC and Public Health Engineering
Department (PHED).[1]
The total water supply in Indore is 216 MLD. The present per capita availability of
water to Indore is 86 litres per day, which is inadequate. There needs to be
improvement and repair of existing networks to curb the losses as the present supply
networks are inefficient with leakages. To improve water supply facilities, steps would
be taken to involve experienced private companies to take care of the operations and
maintenance facilities. IMC, IDA, Department of Water Supply and Sanitation [1] are
working for proper laying out of water supply lines. Electricity cables are laid down by
IDA, MP Indore Electricity Board and Madhya Pradesh Paschim Kshetra Vidyut Vitaran
Company Limited [2] Telecommunication cables are looked after by IDA, CPCB and
BSNLThe inter city and intra city operations are handled by private agencies in contract
with MPSRTC. [1] But there are a few issues that Indore faces when it comes to public
transport. The mobility of the traffic is poor due numerous junctions with high traffic
intensity. Many areas in the city face parking problems. The bus terminals are located
in the densely developed areas that causes traffic congestion. A unique initiative has
been taken up by the IMC by setting up a government owned company Indore City
Transport Services Limited (ICTSL) to provide high capacity low floor buses on about 18
routes in the city. Traffic channelization and segregation, public transport are handled
by IDA, IMC, Indore City Transport Services Limited (ICTSL) and state PWD.
[1Vegetation is looked after by NHAI, horticulture department and Ministry of
Environment and Forests (MoUF.
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